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Option 1 Sliplining-Description Qty. Unit
Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

MOBILIZATION 1 LS $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $0.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18,550.00 $18,550.00 $0.00 $18,500.00 $18,550.00
REMOVALS 1 LS $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $0.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
CLEARING AND GRUBBING 1 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $0.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00
FLOW CONTROL 1 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $0.00 $14,500.00 $14,500.00
HDPE LINER PIPE FOR 60" DIA. CMP, 48" O.D. (46.64" O.D.) 97 LF $200.00 $19,400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $328.00 $31,816.00 $0.00 $328.00 $31,816.00
HDPE LINER PIPE FOR 60" DIA. CMP, 54" O.D. (53.8" O.D.) 225 LF $230.00 $51,750.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $390.00 $87,750.00 $0.00 $390.00 $87,750.00
HDPE LINER PIPE FOR 72" DIA. CMP, 63" O.D. (61.5" O.D.) 116 LF $260.00 $30,160.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $492.00 $57,072.00 $0.00 $492.00 $57,072.00
HDPE LINER PIPE FOR 84" DIA. CMP, 63" O.D. (68" O.D.) 59 LF $325.00 $19,175.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $442.00 $26,078.00 $0.00 $442.00 $26,078.00
CONCRETE BULKHEADS 5 CY $125.00 $625.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,815.00 $14,075.00 $0.00 $2,815.00 $14,075.00
GROUTING OF ANNULAR SPACE 115 CY $100.00 $11,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $341.50 $39,272.50 $0.00 $341.50 $39,272.50
8'x4' TYPE M INLET 2 EA $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6,900.00 $13,800.00 $0.00 $6,900.00 $13,800.00
43"x68" ELLIPTICAL CONCRETE PIPE 32 LF $250.00 $8,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $443.00 $14,176.00 $0.00 $443.00 $14,176.00
TYPE I ROLLED STONE BASE, 6" THICK 143 SY $10.00 $1,430.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34.00 $4,862.00 $0.00 $34.00 $4,862.00
6" THICK, 4000 PSI PCC PAVEMENT 143 SY $85.00 $12,155.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $115.00 $16,445.00 $0.00 $115.00 $16,445.00
TYPE 2 ROCK BLANKET WITH FILTER FABRIC 25 CY $80.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $80.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $80.00 $2,000.00
TYPE 3 ROCK BLANKET WITH FILTER FABRIC 26 CY $90.00 $2,340.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $140.00 $3,640.00 $0.00 $140.00 $3,640.00
RESTORATION 1 LS $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $0.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

$205,535.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $436,036.50 NO BID $436,036.50
Bid Response Y
Work Authorization Certification Y
Statement of Bidders Qualifications Y
Anti-Collusion Statement Y
Bid Bond Y
Signature and Identity of Bidder Y
Bidders Acknowledgment Y

Bid Total 

BID TABULATION Utility Solutions, LLC
Vee Jay Cement 

Contracting Co., Inc.

25-08JUN17 - TRENCHLESS CULVERT REHAB-2017

Rhad A. BakerENGINEER'S ESTIMATE Ace Pipe Cleaning, Inc. AVERAGE BIDLexeco, Inc
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